FRANKLIN REGIONAL COOPERATIVE WINTER SAND BID W1-2012
Contracts October 1, 2011 through September 30, 2012

Bid Opening Sept. 8, 2011

Contractsawardedn Bold

. George D .
Delta Sand Mltche_ll Lane Const, Judg& G&S Lyman Hinsdale H.C. Kocot Bob C_ook
and Gravel Inc| Excavating 216 Mt Porter Gravel 855 Excavating 7
Sons, 145 81 West . and Sons PO
Name of Company PO Box 395 | Inc. 191 |Hermon Sta| Trans, 61 Berkshire | Orange Rd Northfield Box 275 So. Deacon Parker
Amherst Rd |Reynolds Rd Rd, Tully Rd, . Rd . Rd
. Trail W, | Orange, MA . Deerfield,
Sunderland, | Shelburne, | Northfield, |Orange, MA Goshen 01364 Hinsdale, MA 01373 Bernardston
MA 01375 | MA 01370 MA . NH 03451 MA 01337
MA 01032
Prices for Picked Up Available |estimated 413-665-4051. 413-625- | 413-498- | 978-575- | 413-268- 978-544- 603-336- 413-665-
To All Participants amt 2124 5586 0567 7590 6765 7783 2735 413-648-5365
Picked up price per ton 11,400 $7.75 $7.00 $5.25| $10.00/cy|no bid p/u [no bid p/u  |no bid p/u |no bid p/u  [no bid p/u
Bernardston washed 200
Colrain screened 2,000
Deerfield screened 1,000
Gill screened 2,000
Leverett washed 1,400
Leyden screened 200
Shutesbury washed 3,000
Sunderland screened 1,200
Whately washed 400
Location of Storage
Delivered price per ton
Town Preference Delivered
Ashfield screened 3,000 $13.45 $12.00 $9.50 $12.50
Bernardston washed 2,800 $12.30 $7.50 $7.55 $7.75
Buckland washed 1,000 $13.55 $9.50 $10.45
Colrain screened 4,500 $13.55 $9.95
Conway screened 2,500 $10.40 $10.00 $11.05
Deerfield screened 4,000 $10.15 $9.50
Greenfield washed 6,500 $11.75 $9.20 $8.75 $10.15
Leverett washed 500 $10.20 $10.00
Leyden screened 2,000 $13.75 $9.50 $10.15 $10.10
Montague washed 4,000 $11.50 $9.15 $8.75 $10.00
Orange bid cy screened 3,500 $20.25 $12.00 $7.90
Shelburne screened 2,000 $12.75 $9.00
Shutesbury washed 400 $11.75 $12.00
Sunderland screened 800 $9.80 $12.00 $9.45
Warwick screened 4,400 $14.75 $12.00 $9.75 $12.00 $8.95
Wendell washed 3,000 $12.40 $11.00
Whately washed 2,000 $9.90 $10.00 $10.00
Total
in cubic yds in cubic yds
COARSE WINTER SAND
. George D .
Delta Sand Mitchell  [Lane Const, Hinsdale
and Gravel Inc| Excavating 216 Mt Porter Sc;]:sdd ilS Gi‘lsvb};gan Gravel 855 H.C. Kooot EBOb (i,OOk7
Prices for Picked Up Available PO Box 395 Inc. 191 |Hermon Sta| Trans, 61 Berléshire Orange Rd Northfield nd S noclgo Dxcav;i :‘?k ;
To All Participants Amherst Rd | Reynolds Rd Rd, TullyRd, | 5w Lo VA Rd and >ons eacon Parke
. Sunderland, | Shelburne, | Northfield, |Orange, MA| " Y. | ©range, Hinsdale, |B0X 275 So. Rd
Estimated MA 01375 | MA 01370 MA Goshen, 01364 NH 03451 | Deerfield, | Bernardston
Amt MA 01032 MA 01373 MA 01337
Picked up price per ton 3,500 $7.95 $7.00 $6.50
Leverett washed 200
Leyden screened 100
Northfield screened 3,000
Shutesbury washed 100
Whately washed 100
Location of Storage
Delivered price per ton 9,800.00
Town Preference Delivered
Charlemont screened 3,000 $13.85 $10.10
Heath screened 3,000 $15.60 $11.25
Leverett washed 100 $10.50 $10.00 $11.40
Leyden screened 100 $13.95 $9.50
Northfield screened 2,500 $13.20 $7.50 $7.50 $6.90
Orange incy screened 500 $20.55 $7.90
Shutesbury washed 100 $11.95 $12.00 $12.10
Whately washed 500 $10.10 $10.00 $11.00
Bid Tab SAND OPN 12.XLS A. Woods, CPO TEL 413-774-3167 x 104 12/22/2011
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